

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: **Purchase of Various Types of Light Duty Trucks**  
 TIME & DATE: **3:00 p.m., May 14, 2020**

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL	MAKE/MODEL	Gunn Buick, GMC, Ltd. 16449 IH 35N Selma, TX 78154	Grapevine Dodge Chrysler Jeep 2601 Willia D Tate Grapevine, TX 76051	Sport City Toyota 12650 LBJ Freeway Dallas, TX 75228	Lake Country Chevrolet 2152 N. Wheeler Jasper, TX 75951	Moore Chrysler Dodge Jeep Ram 1305 Hwy 96 Bypass Silsbee, TX 77656	Grande Truck Center 4562 IH 10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	Ancira Chrysler Jeep Dodge 10807 IH 10 West San Antonio, TX 78250
A.	24 ea. 6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, club, double, super cab pickup State Make, Model	27,074.15	649,779.60	GMC 1/2 Ton 2WD	27,074.15	27,658.00	28,900.00	27,128.00	25,509.00	29,971.00	* <b>25,100.00</b>
					649,779.60	663,792.00	693,600.00	651,072.00	612,216.00	719,304.00	<b>602,400.00</b>
					GMC 1/2 Ton 2WD	2020 Ram 1500	8242	Chev Silverado 1500	Dodge Ram 1500	2020 Ford F150	<b>Ram 1500</b>
B.	8 ea. 11,000 GVWR (minimum) two wheel drive extended cab truck with installed service body State Make, Model	54,117.53	432,940.24	GMC 1 Ton 2WD	54,117.53	NO BID	NO BID	55,954.00	NO BID	* <b>55,657.00</b>	NO BID
					432,940.24			447,632.00		<b>445,256.00</b>	
					GMC 1 Ton 2WD			Chev Silverado 2500		<b>2020 Ford F150</b>	
C.	2 ea. 6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, club, double, super cab pickup State Make, Model	29,917.75	59,835.50	GMC 1/2 Ton 4WD	29,917.75	32,480.00	31,427.00	30,067.00	*	33,837.00	NO BID
					59,835.50	64,960.00	62,854.00	60,134.00		67,674.00	
					GMC 1/2 Ton 4WD	2020 Ram 1500	8342	Chev Silverado 1500	<b>Dodge Ram 1500</b>	2020 Ford F150	
D.	1 ea. 6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, club, installed service body & 2,000 lbs. cap. Crane State Make, Model	34,733.25	34,733.25	GMC 1/2 Ton 4WD	34,733.25	33,502.00	ITEM NOT TABULATED NON RESPONSIVE	33,446.00	*	38,587.00	NO BID
					34,733.25	33,502.00		33,446.00		38,587.00	
					GMC 1/2 Ton 4WD	2020 Ram 1500		Chev Silverado 1500	<b>Dodge Ram 1500</b>	2020 Ford F150	
	Terms				Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days
	Delivery Days				120-160 days	120 days	90 days	150-180 days	150-180 days	150-180 days	150-200 days

**\*LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Alamo City Chevrolet  
 Ancira Chrysler, Jeep, Dodge Ram  
 Bluebonnet Chrysler Dodge  
 Caldwell Country Chevrolet  
 Grande Truck Center  
 Grapevine  
 Gunn Buick

Jordan Ford  
 Moore Dodge  
 North Park Toyota  
 Red McCombs Toyota  
 Sam Pack's Five Star Ford  
 Silsbee Ford  
 Sports City Toyota  
 Toyota of Boerne

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website